
Happy Friday!

Former TWR guests, Elsa and her mother, donated twenty pairs of
new shoes to The Women's Room! Mom had been a TWR and pantry
client for a few years and when her daughter Elsa found herself
unemployed, Mom introduced her to Friends In Deed and our
services. Thankfully, both Elsa and her mom are now doing well,
employed and, when she found shoes for $1, she bought them to
give back. They were able to come with their daughter and
granddaughter to bring these gifts. Three generations of this family
came together to spread love, hope, and give back to their
community. 

With summer upon us, we need all sorts of donations: water bottles,
women's undergarments, women's summertime clothing, sunscreen,
chapstick and cooling towels, etc. Please drop off items on Fridays
and Saturdays from 8:30am-3:30pm, or order online and have them
delivered to our FID House. We want to make sure our clients and
guests, especially those on the streets that our outreach team
encounter, can get the critical necessities to keep cool and safe.

And, finally, we received some incredible and surprising news this
week: Friends In Deed has been named Nonprofit of the Year for
California’s 25th District! We are so humbled and grateful to Senator
Anthony Portantino for this award; this is a recognition of all the hard
work and dedication of our staff, board members, and tremendous

http://friendsindeedpas.org/fid/donate/
http://friendsindeedpas.org/fid/legacy-society/


volunteers. On a personal note, I have known Senator Portantino for
many years and am honored to call him my representative and
friend. You will hear more about this in the coming weeks, but we
couldn’t wait to share the good news with you!

Without all of your generosity and support, none of what we do
would be possible, so thank you!

Blessings and have a lovely weekend (try to stay cool!),

Rabbi Joshua

​Friends In Deed
is committed to fostering, cultivating, and preserving a culture of
diversity, equity and inclusion. We embrace and celebrate the

spectrum of our employees’, volunteers’, and clients’ ages, color,
ability or disability, ethnicity, family or marital status, gender

identity or expression, language, national origin, physical and
mental ability, political affiliation, race, religion, sexual orientation,
socio-economic status, veteran status, neurodiversity, and other
characteristics that make our employees, volunteers, and clients

unique.

​We can only operate with your help!

 ​  ​  ​

https://friendsindeedpas.org/fid/donate-to-friends-in-deed/
https://www.facebook.com/FriendsInDeedPasadena/
https://twitter.com/FID_Pasadena
https://www.instagram.com/fid_pasadena/?hl=en






We are proud of Friends In Deed supporter, Simone Zienna, and his
company Meta Nutrition (metnu.com) for being named LA Business

Journal's 20 in the 20s. Congratulations Simone!

http://metnu.com




Special gift from The Women's Room guest, Gwendolyn! We wrote
about Gwen previously and she stopped by FID to pass along some
sweet notes and gifts to our TWR staff. Gwen has been accepted to

USC and has now moved in to her dorm!


